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A SCHWARZ-PICK LEMMA FOR THE MODULUS OF HOLOMORPHIC
MAPPINGS FROM THE POLYDISK INTO THE UNIT BALL

SHAOYU DAI AND YIFEI PAN

ABSTRACT. In this paper we prove a Schwarz-Pick lemma for the modulus of holomorphic mappings
from the polydisk into the unit ball. This result extends some related results.

MSC (2000): 32HO02.
Keywords: holomorphic mappings; Schwarz-Pick lemma; the polydisk.

1. INTRODUCTION

Let D be the unit disk in C, D™ and B,, be the polydisk and the unit ball in C" respectively. For

z=(z1,+,2n) and 2/ = (2},--- ,2.) € C", denote (z,2') = 21%, + -+ + 2,7, and |2| = (z, 2)'/%
Let Qxy be the class of all holomorphic mappings f from X into Y, where X is a domain in C"
and Y is a domain in C™. For f € Q0xy and j =1,--- ,n, define
VIfI(z)| =  sup im  AEHB AR -y (1.1)
BeCn, |B|=1 teR,t—01 t
V;1f1(z)| = sup tim 2o 2 T8 e e z) 711 zeX, (12)
J BEC, |B|=1 \t€R,t—0F t ’ ’

where f = (f1,---, fm)s |f| = (If1]> +--- + |fm|2)% and z = (21, ,2,). Some calculation for
|V|fl| and |V;|f|| will be given in Section 2.
For f € Qpp, the classical Schwarz-Pick lemma says that

_ 1P

FEI< T2k zeb (1.3)

This inequality does not hold for f € Qpg,, with m > 2. For instance, the mapping f(z) = 12(2, 1)

S

satisfies
1£'(0)] = V1= [F(0)2 > 1—|£(0).

However Pavlovié¢ [3] found that (I3]) can also be written as

1—|f(2)?
vinis TEEE e, (1.4
since (23)). In [3], Pavlovié proved that this form (I4]) can be extended to Qpp,, and obtained the
same inequality for f € Qp,,. Recently, we [I] proved that the form (I.4) also can be extended to
(g, B,, and obtained the following inequality for f € Qg B,,:
1—|f(2)?
visiel < T 2OE ses (15)
In view of the above results, it is interesting for us to consider that if there are some similar results
for f S QDan.

Research supported by the National Natural Science Foundation of China (No. 11201199) and by the Scientific
Research Foundation of Jinling Institute of Technology (No. Jit-b-201221).
1


http://arxiv.org/abs/1307.8321v1

2 SHAOYU DAI AND YIFEI PAN

For f € Qpn p, it is well known [4] 2] that

n

YA ImPIL < 1= 1f (=) (1.6)
j=1
for any z = (21,---,2,) € D™. This inequality does not hold for f € Qpn g, with m > 2. For

instance, the mapping f(z) = %(zl, 72 +0.1) € Qpa p, satisfies

2
2
T (0)] = —= >1—|f(0)]

]Z::llf ;0] 7 £ (0)]

Similarly to (L4]), we find that (L6 can be written as
A=zl < 1= 1P (1.7)
j=1

for any z = (21, -+ ,2n) € D", since (2.H). In view of (L4]) and (LI]), the obvious question is that if

the form (7)) can be extended to Qpn» g, with m > 2. The following example shows that the form

(L) can not completely be extended to Qpnp,, with m > 2: the mapping f(z) = %(21,22) €

Qp2 g, satisfies

2
SOIVSIAO)] = V2> 1—[£(0)P,
j=1

since f(0) =0 and |V;[f[(0)] = |fL,(0)[ for j = 1,2 by (2.4]). However we find that the form (L.7)
holds for f € Qpn ,, at the point z € D" with f(z) # 0. Precisely:

Theorem 1. Let f: D" — B, be a holomorphic mapping with m > 2. Then

n

Z(l—IZjlz)Ilefl(Z)lSl—lf(Z)lz, if f(2)#0 (1.8)
and "
i(1—|21|2)2|Vj|f|(2)l2SL if f(z)=0 (1.9)
for oy == (o, 2) €D

The above theorem is the main result in this paper. Note that the inequality in (L9]) always
holds whether if f(z) = 0 or f(z) # 0. When f(z) # 0, there is a better inequality, which is
(L8). Theorem 1 is coincident with (I.5]) when n = 1. In addition, (L8) and (L9)) are sharp. For

1_ 1_
example, the mapping f(z) = % <12_ ;11 ) %) € Qpe p, satisfies the equality in (L8] at z = 0;

the mapping f(z) = %(21, 22) € Qp2 p, satisfies the equality in (L3) at z = 0.

In Section 2, some calculation for |V|f|| and |V;|f|| will be given. In Section 3, we will give the
proof of Theorem [Il and some remarks for the equality cases in Theorem 1.

2. SOME CALCULATION FOR |V|f|| AND |V;|f]|

For f € Qxy with X € C" and Y € C™, by (L) we know that if |f|(z) # O then |f] is
R-differentiable at z and V|f| is the ordinary gradient; if | f|(z) = 0 then |f] is not R-differentiable
at z and V|f| is not the ordinary gradient. From Section 2 in [I], we have the following (2.1])-(2.3)).
For f e XY

T [ ((FL @ F@)) e (L F )L i f(2) #0;
IVIfI(2)] = sup |Df(z)-pl, it f(z) =0, (2.1)

peCn, |Bl=1
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where z = (z1,--+ ,2,) € X and Df(z) - 8 is the Fréchet derivative of f at z in the direction .
Then for f € Qxy with X C C,

S FENL i f(2) #0;
\V. — I 2.2
e {|f'<z>|, it f)=0 .
In particular, for f € Qxy with X CCand Y CC,
V()] = £/ (2)]- (2.3)
Then by ([.2) and ([2.2), we get that for f € Qxy and j=1,--- ,n,
(5015 £ £ 0
Vilfl(2)] = 4 T [AS (2.4)
v {\f;j@)r, it f(z)=0,

where z = (z1,--+ ,2,) € X. Note that for the case that f(z) # 0, if féj (z) and f(z) are collinear,
then |V;|f|(2)] = [fZ,(2)]; if not, then [V;|f[(2)] # [fZ,(z)|. In particular, for f € Qxy with
Y c C,

IVil£I(2)] = 1£2; (2)]- (2.5)

3. PROOF oF THEOREM [I]

First we give one lemma.

Lemma 1. Let f(z) = Y aqa2* € Qprp,,, where z = (21, ,2,), @ = (a1, -+ ,qp), 2% =
2028, f=(f fm)s Fj(2) =20 a5,02% and aq = (@105, Gm,a). Then
D laal* <1 (3.1)
Proof. For 0 < o < 1, we have
1 2w 2w ) )
1> n/ / |f(oe®, - oe®)|2dh; - - - db,
(2m)"™ Jo 0
= 1 f:/%.r../% |f.(aei61 aew")|2d01---d9n
(2m)n =i/ 0 ’ b
=3 sl
i=1 @
- Z |aa 20?1,
where |a| = ) «a;. Letting o — 1 gives (3.1]). O
j=1
Now we give the proof of Theorem [I1
Proof of Theorem[1. First we prove the case that z = 0.
Therefore we need to prove that
Sy VAFO) < 1 [FO)R, i £(0) #0; 5
Yo V5O < 1, if f(0)=0
By (2.4), it suffices to prove that
S |(r o HE <1170, it g0 20 (33

=1
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and
Z|fzj (0)?> <1, if f(0)=0. (3.4)

Obviously, (3:4) holds by Lemmaﬂl For (33), let
h(z):<f(z),L0)>, z e D™

|£(0)]
Then h(z) is a holomorphic function from D" into D, h(0) = |f(0)|, and for j =1,--- ,n,
/ oy 40 >
h,.(0) = (0), 7= 3.5
L = (75,0075 (35)

where z = (21, -+, 2z,). Applying (LG) to h and by ([B.3) we get

- ’ LO) _ - /
Z<@Wuwﬂ‘gm”)
<1-|n(0)

j=1
=1-1f(0).

Then (B.3) is proved. Therefore ([3.2]) is proved.
Now we prove the case that z = p # 0.

Let p = (p1,--- ,pn) and
gw) = fle(w)),  w=(wi, - ,w,) €D,

—wy

where p(w) = (1(w1), -, en(wn)), @;(w;) = 12 = fOI‘j =1,---,n. Then g(w) is a holomorphic

mapping from D" into B,,, ¢(0) = f(p), and for j = 1 n,
9w, (0) = f2,(p)(—1 + |py| )- (3.6)
For the case that f(p) # 0, applying B3)) to g and by (24), (3:6) we get
’ f(p) >‘
(#05705

n

A=)Vl =) 1~ lp)
j=1

j=1

j=1
<1—1g(0)?
=1-|f)
For the case that f(p) = 0, applying (3.4) to g and by (24]), (B.6) we get
D =1 P2IV5IAP1P =D (=111, ()
j=1 j=1
=19k, (0)?
j=1
<1.
Then the theorem is proved. g

In the following, we give some remarks for the equality cases in Theorem 1.
Remark 1. When n = 1, (L8] and (L9) reduce to (LH). The equality case in (LI) has been
discussed in [1J.
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Remark 2. When n > 2, if the equality in (I.9) holds at some point p = (p1,--- ,pn), then the
structure of the expression of f will be controlled. Precisely:

n
F&) =Y £+ =L, zeD,
= D%
which is obvious by the proof of Theorem 1, Lemma 1 and (2.4)).

Remark 3. When n > 2, if the equality in (L8) holds at some point p = (p1, - ,pn), then
the following discussion shows that the equality at p is not enough to control the structure of the
expression of f. By the proof of Theorem 1, we know that the key to the extremal problem of
(L8) at the point p is to solve the extremal problem of (L6 at z = 0. That is: for h € Qpn p, if
> [ (0)) =1— |h(0)]2, then what the structure of the expression of h is. By the proof of (ILL6)
in [4], we only need to consider this problem: for h € Qpnp with h(0) = 0, if >77, [ (0)| = 1,
then what the structure of the expression of h is. However, the following examples show that

the condition »7%_, |h’zj(0)| = 1 can not control the higher order terms in the expansion of h.
Consequently, the structure of the expression of A can not be controlled.
Examples:
1 1
g(Z) = =21+ =% € QDQ’D;
2 2
1 1
- 521 T 522 — 2122
g(z) = 2 2 T € Qpz p.

1-— %21 — 522
Although the above two functions satisfy g(0) = g(0) = 0, ¢,(0) = g.,(0), ¢.,(0) = g.,(0) and
E?:l | g;j 0)] = Z?:l | f];j (0)] = 1, the expression of g has no higher order terms and the expression
of g has some higher order terms.
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