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Abstract

We show that the inequality/ (A|B, X) + H(A|B,Y) < H(A|B) for jointly distributed random variables
A, B, X, Y, which does not hold in general case, holds under some haturdition on the support of the probability
distribution of A, B, X, Y. This result generalizes a version of the conditional ltayleinequality: if for some
distribution (X : Y|A) = H(A|X,Y) =0, thenI(A: B) < I(A: B|X)+I(A:BlY)+ I(X :Y).

We present two applications of our result. The first one ifthlewing easy-to-formulate combinatorial theorem:
assume that the edges of a bipartite graph are partitiortiediinmatchings such that for each pair (left vertex
right vertexy) there is at most one matching in the partition involvingtbetandy; assume further that the degree
of each left vertex is at least and the degree of each right vertex is at leRstThen K > LR. The second
application is a new method to prove lower bounds for bidigoverings of bipartite graphs.

Index Terms

Shannon entropy, conditional information inequalitiesnnShannon type information inequalities, biclique
covering

. INTRODUCTION

The most general and fundamental properties of Shannotrgpgncan be expressed in the language of linear
inequalities. The usual universal information inequaditithe linear inequalities that hold for Shannon’s enaepi
of jointly distributed tuples of random variables for evalistribution) have many equivalent characterizations
and interpretations in very different areas — these indtigigican be equivalently reformulated in the settings of
Kolmogorov complexity and group theory; they give chareezsgions of the network coding capacity rates, of the
cardinalities of projections of finite sets, etc., see theveys in [11], [5]. The parallelism and interplay between
different “incarnation” of information inequalities leaad their better understanding and to more efficient appboat
of this technique. However, there exists a class of morei@kadbrmation inequalities that still lack a satisfactory
explanation and have no clear combinatorial interpratafithese are theonditional linear information inequalities
which hold only for distributions that satisfy some constta. The first nontrivial example of a conditional linear
information inequality was proven in the seminal papér §e a survey of other similar results in[12]. Until now,
these inequalities looked like artifacts without pradtimatheoretical application. In this paper, we argue thahso
conditional inequalities can be naturally interpreted imgy combinatorial terms. We propose a new “conditional
information inequality,” discuss its combinatorial meagiand show how it can be employed in pure combinatorial
proofs.

Let A, X,Y be jointly distributed discrete random variables. In thigoer, we consider the inequality
H(AIX)+ H(A)Y) < H(A), (1)

where H(-) stands for Shannon’s entropy. For someX,Y this inequality is false, e.g., for constait Y and
non-constantd. We provide a natural condition on the distribution 4f X, Y implying inequality [1). Then we
provide two combinatorial applications of the resultingnditional inequality and show that it implies the conditidn
inequality from [10].
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More specifically we consider the following condition:
for each quadruple, d’, x,y, if the probabilities of all four events
[A=a,X =z2],[A=0aY =yl,[A=d, X =2z2],[A=d,Y =1] 2
are positive, them = a’.
Theorem 1. The inequality(T)) holds for all random variablesi, X, Y satisfying (2).

We first prove this theorem and then show its combinatorigliegtions.

Il. NOTATION

To simplify formulas, we use the following notation for therginal distributions (conditional and unconditional):
p(a) denotesPr[A = a|, p(a,z) = Pr[A = a, X = z], p(a|z) = Pr[A = a|X = z], p(a,y) =Pr[A =a, Y =y],
and so on.

If X is a random variable anél is an event in the same probabilistic space (8] > 0)), we denote by
X|€ the conditional distribution ofX, i.e., the restriction ofX on the subspace corresponding to the eerftor
example, for jointly distributed random variabléX,Y) we denote byX|(Y = y) the conditional distribution of
X under the assumptionn = y.

I1l. THE PROOF OFTHEOREM[]]

We apply the method of [2]/.[3]. The crucial property of inedjty (1) is that no term contains botk andY'.
The inequality[(I1) can be re-written in terms of uncondiéibantropies as follows:

HAX)+HAY)<HX)+HY)+ H(A).
Thus it means that the average value of the logarithm of the ra

p(z)p(y)p(a)

" 3

pla,x)p(a,y)
is less than or equal t6. The average is computed with respect to the distribution z,y). Computing the
average, we take into account only the triptes, y with positive probability. For such triples, both the nuter
and denominator of ratid [3) are positive and hence its idgaris well defined.

Now consider a new distributiop’ where
plax)play) p(a) >0,

/ — p(a)
pla,z,y) {O otherwise.
Random variables distributed accordingfocan be generated by the following process: First generaising
the original distribution of4, then generate independenityusing the conditional distributiom|a andy using the
conditional distributiony|a.

Notice thatp’(a, z,y) is positive if so isp(a,x,y) but not the other way around. However, rafio (3) is still well
defined and positive for all triples, 2,y with positive p’(a, x,y). Therefore we can compute the average value
of the logarithm of [(B) using the distributiopl in place ofp. Moreover, changing the distribution does not affect
the average. Indeed, the logarithm [of (3) is the sum of ltigaus of its factors. Thus it suffices to show that the
average of the logarithm of each factors is not affected wiierreplacep by p’. Let us prove this, say, for the
factor1/p(a, x).

This factor does not depend an Therefore the average of its logarithm does not depend on e, x) is
split amongp(a, x,y) for different valuesy: we just sum ugog1/p(a,z) over all a, z with weightsp(a,x). As
p(a,x) = p'(a,z), summing with weight'(a, z) will yield the same result.

By Jensen’s inequalitythe average value of the logarithm of the rafid (3) with respe the distributiony’ is

at most
log( > p(x)p(y)>-

a,z,y:p' (a,x,y)>0

"We need Jensen’s inequality for logarithmic functionggt. . . , p,, be positive numbers that sum up to 1; theriog &1+ - -+pn log z, <
log(piz1 + -+ + DnZn).



The condition[(R) guarantees that for eachy there is at most one with p(a,z) > 0,p(a,y) > 0 and hence

g > p@p) <log( Y p@)p(y)) =logl =0,
z,Y

a,z,y:p’ (a,z,y)>0

V. COMBINATORIAL APPLICATIONS OF THEOREM(]]
A. A lower bound for the number of matchings in a bipartitegra
From Theoreni]1 we can derive the following combinatoriatesteent:

Corollary 1. Assume that edges of a bipartite graph are partitioned iRtonatchings so that for each pair
(left vertexz, right vertexy)

there is at most one matching in the partition that involveshlx: and y. Assume further that the degree of each
left vertex is at leasf. and the degree of each right vertex is at leastThenK > LR.

Proof: Let M, ..., My denote the given matchings. Consider the uniform distidbubn the set of edges of
the graph. Denote byA, X,Y") the following triple of jointly distributed random variads:

X = [the left end of the edde

Y = [the right end of the edge

A = [the index: of the matchingM; containing the edde
The conditions of the corollary imply that the triplel, X, Y") satisfies[(R): if both eventsd = a, X = z] and
[A =a,Y = y] have positive probabilities, then bothandy are involved in the matching/,, and hence such a
matchingM, is unique. Therefore by Theordm 1 we haiéA|X) + H(A]Y) < H(A).

Notice that for each matching/, the probabilityPr[A = a] is proportional to the size of the matching, i.e., to
the number of edges (equivalently, to the number of vertite®lved in this matching. On the other hand, for each
vertexz involved in a matching\/,, the conditional probabilityer[ X = x| A = q] is inversely proportional the size
of the matching (the left ends of all edges in the matchingehére same probabilities). It follows that for every
fixed vertexz all the matchings\/, coveringz are equiprobable. In other words, conditional n= z, the value
of A is uniformly distributed on the set of all matching that @intan edge incident to. Thus, H(A|X) > log L.
Similarly, we haveH (A|Y") > log R. Hence,H(A) > log L + log R. It follows that the range ofl is at leastLR.

[ |

B. A lower bound for the biclique covering number of bipartifraphs

Definition1. For any bipartite graptiy = (1, V», E') (with the set of vertice¥), UV, and a set of edges C V; x V%)
its biclique covering numbebcc(G) is defined as the minimal number of bicliques (complete bijgasubgraphs)
that cover all edges afr.

Biclique coverings play an important role in communicatioomplexity. Specifically, thenon-deterministic
communication complexitisee [7]) of a predicate

P:UxU—{0,1}

can be defined a®g bce(G) for the bipartite graplz = (V1, Va2, E), whereV, =V, = U, and E is the set of all
pairs (z,y) € U x U such thatP(z,y) = 1.

Corollary 2. Assume that edges of a bi-partite gragh= (1, V», E) are colored in such a way that
(*) for every bicliqueC and for every edge&:’, y) and (z,y’) from C of the same colon, the edge(z, y) also
has colora.
Assume further that a probability distribution over the ed®f the graph is given. Denote b, Y, A) the random
variables where
« X = [the left end of the edge
« Y = [the right end of the edde
« A = [the color of the edde
Thenbec(G) > 25 HAX)THAY)=H(A),



Proof: Assume that this grap&y can be covered by bicliquesCy,. .., C;. Extend the distributiof X, Y, A)
and add another random variable: we defiieas the index of a biclique’; that covers the edgéX,Y). (If
an edge belongs to several bicliqués then we choose any of them.) Notice thatranges ovef1,...,t}, so
H(Z) < logt.

The crucial point is that for a fixed valueof Z the condition[(R) is satisfied. Indeed, assume that pathz|Z =
i) andp(a,y|Z = i) are positive. Then the bicliqué; has edges$z,y’) and(a2’,y), both with colora. By property
(x) the color of the edgéx,y) also equals: and hence such is unique. By Theorerh]1 for each conditional
distribution (A, X,Y")|Z = i the inequality [(1) holds. Hence we get

H(A|X,Z)+ H(AY, Z) < H(A|Z).

It follows that
H(A|IX)—-H(Z)+ H(A)Y)—-H(Z) < H(A).

Thus, we obtaint > 2H(2) > 93 [HAX)+H(AY)-H(A)] m
Let us apply this corollary to a specific bipartite graph. €ider the bipartite graphy,, , = (V1, V2, E), where
both partsl; andV; consist ofk-elements subsets ¢t ..., n}, and the set of edge8 C V; x V;, consists of all

pairs of disjoints sets. Let us color the edgey) in color z Uy and consider the uniform probability distribution
over the edges of this graph. The conditior) is fulfilled. Indeed, assume we are given three disjointair
disjoint k-element subsetsz, y), (z,y’) and (2/,y). Assume further that Uy’ = 2’ Uy = a. Thenz = 2’ and

y =" and hencer Uy = a as well. Hence

bee(Grp,) > 23 HAX)HHAY)—H(A)]

We have (,;) equiprobable colors and hendé(A) = log, (,;). On the other handH (A|X) = H(A]Y) =

logy (",,*). Thus
bee(G ) > \/ (n ; k>2/ (22)

If n>> k then (";k)Q/(i) is close to(%F) ~ 2%* and we obtain a lower bound abaft for bee(Gy )

This bound in itself is of no interest; the simple and stadd@oling set technique (seel[7]) proves for this
graph the boundcc(G) > (2,5) that holds for alln > 2k. However, this simple example illustrates the connection
between biclique covering and conditional informationgualities. It remains unknown whether a similar technique
can surpass the fooling set method for other examples ohgrap

V. A GENERALIZATION OF CONDITIONAL INEQUALITY FROM [10]

The so calledngleton inequalitywas originally formulated and proven proven for ranks oééin subspaces,|[1].
It turns out that a counterpart of this inequality reformethin terms of Shannon’s entropy (for random variables)
has many nontrivial applications. Though in general theginality is not valid for entropies (see [4]), it holds for
distributions that satisfy some special properties (éog.random variables that enjoy the property of extractimg t
mutual information, or for variables with some propertiésnolependence, see, e.d.} [2]] [&] [6] [9]). In partiaula
in [10] it was shown that Ingleton’s inequality for entropibolds for all distributions where the entropies satisfy
some linear constraints:

Theorem 2 ([10]). If random variablesX, Y, A, B satisfy the the constraints
I(X:Y|A) = HAIX,Y) =0, (4)
then Ingleton’s inequality
I(A:B)<I(A:B|X)+I(A:BlY)+I(X:Y). (5)

holds for this distribution.



A noteworthy fact is that this result cannot be obtained asrecdimplication of any unconditional linear
inequality for Shannon’s entropy. More precisely, whatgyair of reals\;, A, we take, the inequality

I(A:B)<I(A:B|X)+I(A: B|Y)+I(X :Y)+
FAI(X - Y|A) + M H(A|X,Y)

does not hold for some distributions, seel[12].
Ingleton’s inequality[(b) can be equivalently rewritten as

H(A|X,B)+ H(A|Y,B) < H(A|B) + I(X : Y|A) + H(A|X,Y).
Under the constraint§](4), this inequality is equivalent to

H(AIX,B) + H(A|Y, B) < H(A|B). (6)
Therefore Theorernl 2 can be reformulated as follows:
I(X:Y|A)=H(A|X,Y)=0= H(A|X,B) + H(A|Y,B) < H(A|B). @)

Notice that the right hand side dfl(7) (i.e., the inequa@) (is a relativized version of (1) (the woreélativization
here means that we insert new condition in all entropy eiwes). Because of this similarity we can deduce
Theoren 2 from our TheoreM 1. To show this, we need to explainimplications:

(i) the condition of [(¥) (i.e., the constraini (4)) implies tbendition [2),

(i) the condition[(R) implies (due to Theordrh 1) the inequa@y (i.e., the conclusion of{7)).

First we prove i).

Lemma 1. If a tuple of random variable$A, X, Y) satisfies(d)), then it satisfies als).
Proof: Inequality /(X : Y|A) = 0 means that

p(a,z,y)p(a) = p(a, r)p(a,y)

for all triples a, z,y. Thus it implies that for each triple, z,y of values ofA, X,Y, if both probabilitiesp(a, x)
andp(a,y) are positive, them(a, z,y) is also positive. Hence, if for some «’, z, y all the four probabilities

p(a,x),p(a,y),pld,x),p(d’, y)
are positive (the assumption df] (2)), then it follows thag frobabilitiesp(a, z,y) and p(a’, z,y) must be also
positive.
Now we employ the conditiod (A|X,Y") = 0 (which means that the value of is a deterministic function of
(X,Y)). If both probabilitiesp(a,z,y) andp(a’, z,y) are positive, them = o', and we obtain the conclusion of

2. [ |
Now we proceed toii) and explain how to deducgl(6) froml (2). The key observatiothat the condition[(2)

is “relativizable”: the property[(2) remains true if we néstt the initial probabilistic space to some subspace.

Lemma 2. If a tuple of random variable$A, X,Y") satisfieg(2), then for each eversl having positive probability
the conditional random variables @¢f4, X,Y")|E satisfy (2).
Proof: Assume that the four probabilities
PriX =2, A=a |&],Pr]Y =y, A=a |&],
Pr[X =z, A=d|E],Pr]Y =y, A=d|€]
are positive. Then the unconditional probability of eachhefse events is positive as well and hence o’ by (2).
[ |

Now we see tha{(6) follows from the conditidn (2). Indeed,dvery possible valué of B Lemmal2 guarantees
that [2) remains valid conditional on the evdst= b. By Theorenill this implies

H(A|X,B =1b)+ H(A|Y,B =b) < H(A|B = b),

and taking the average over all valuesve get [(6). This claim can be formulated as the following darg of
Theorentll (generalizing Theordrh 2 in the foim (7)).

Corollary 3. The inequality(@) holds for all random variablesi, B, X,Y satisfying(2).
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